
Serie Mio-N excel by tability to combine
nice  smooth  design  with  convenience.
The Mio-N cistern with side water inlet is
offered with a flushing mechanism Dual
Flush 4,5/3 litres of water or without the
flushing mechanism as a spare part. The
cistern can be ordered with the special
surface  finish  JIKA  Perla  (batch  100),
which  faci l i tates  maintenance  and
extends lifetime. We recommend the tank
with fitting for combination toilet pan Mio-
N  H826716###0001.  We  provide  an
extended warranty of 10 years for JIKA
ceramic  products.  We  give  a  5-year
warranty  on  the  fittings  placed  in  the
cisterns.  Available  2Q  2024.

Cistern, side water inlet

Spalvos ir variantai
H8297120007621 Balta/su Dual
Flush nuleidimo mechanizmu 4,5/3L,
šoniniu vandens įvadu
H8297121007621 Balta-JIKAperla/su
Dual Flush nuleidimo mechanizmu
4,5/3L, šoniniu vandens įvadu

Mio N H829712
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